

2016 Susquehanna County Upset Sales

Wednesday, May 24, 2017

Updated 3:00 PM

04-BRIDGewater TOWNSHIP

Sale # 25 Control 04-038426 Map Number 143.06-2,001.02,404 Minimum Bid \$1,144.21
Name BICKFORD, SHARON RUTH Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

Sale # 26 Control 04-037140 Map Number 143.06-2,001.02,011 Minimum Bid \$1,478.60
Name BODIE, BRYAN Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

Sale # 27 Control 04-037222 Map Number 143.06-2,001.02,010 Minimum Bid \$1,480.49
Name BOWOLES, HARRY Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

Sale # 34 Control 04-039809 Map Number 161.08-1,042.00,007 Minimum Bid \$1,185.63
Name HOLLISTER, GALEN Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

Sale # 36 Control 04-053936 Map Number 143.06-2,001.02,012 Minimum Bid \$1,269.49
Name KNIGHT, CORTNEY Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

Sale # 41 Control 04-058546 Map Number 143.06-2,001.02,408 Minimum Bid \$359.77
Name PENNY, PAUL Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

Sale # 46 Control 04-052163 Map Number 143.06-2,001.02,018 Minimum Bid \$1,500.49
Name THOMPSON, ROGER Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

05-BROOKLY TOWNSHIP

Sale # 51 Control 05-002641 Map Number 183.03-1,061.00,000 Minimum Bid \$3,057.87
Name ODELL, JAMES Bid No Bid

Status **NO BID** Co-Owner HAZEL ODELL Acreage .50

07-CLIFFORD TOWNSHIP

Sale # 64	Control	07-015296	Map Number	264.00-2,022.00,000	Minimum Bid	\$77,233.76	
	Name	CLIFFORD PLAZA GROUP, LLC			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner	& SEQUOIA PROPERTY GROUP, LLC			Acreage	6.73
Sale # 65	Control	07-015174	Map Number	264.00-2,021.00,000	Minimum Bid	\$114,631.18	
	Name	CLIFFORD PLAZA, LLC			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner	& SEQUOIA PROPERTY GROUP, LLC			Acreage	10.74
Sale # 70	Control	07-015852	Map Number	226.00-2,038.00,000	Minimum Bid	\$12,960.83	
	Name	HOLTON INCORPORATED			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	2.00
Sale # 78	Control	07-015855	Map Number	245.00-3,063.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$576.26	
	Name	REYNOLDS, CHARLES & MARY			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	.07
Sale # 82	Control	07-016174	Map Number	245.00-3,071.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$493.59	
	Name	WILLIAMS, LEO & GISELA JR			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	.07

09-FOREST CITY BOROUGH W1

Sale # 89	Control	09-003545	Map Number	268.11-1,020.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$6,304.96	
	Name	BLOOMER, ALAN C			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	.17

10-FOREST CITY BOROUGH W2

Sale # 103	Control	10-003858	Map Number	249.19-2,039.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$1,152.81	
	Name	BRUSSELL, JOSEPH			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	.14
Sale # 109	Control	10-004094	Map Number	249.19-2,002.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$13,276.91	
	Name	MY HOUSE LLC			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	.05
Sale # 117	Control	10-003973	Map Number	268.07-3,033.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$5,172.19	
	Name	TWILLEY, BERNADETTE M			Bid	No Bid	
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner				Acreage	.09

Sale # 118	Control	10-004148	Map Number	268.07-2,042.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$6,983.93
	Name	TWILLEY, ROBERT J			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner			Acreeage	.17

12-FRANKLIN TOWNSHIP

Sale # 128	Control	12-004929	Map Number	067.00-2,057.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$3,955.25
	Name	HADLICK, TAMMY			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner			Acreeage	2.17

14-GIBSON TOWNSHIP

Sale # 137	Control	14-005423	Map Number	207.01-1,016.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$4,605.18
	Name	PEREZ, KELLY			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner	& SUSAN HANCOCK		Acreeage	.35

16-GREAT BEND TOWNSHIP

Sale # 154	Control	16-006657	Map Number	033.00-1,041.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$5,069.70
	Name	TRAINOR, FRANK			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner			Acreeage	.23

18-HARFORD TOWNSHIP

Sale # 164	Control	18-007434	Map Number	167.13-1,004.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$24,146.30
	Name	FBO LLC			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner	PO BOX 141		Acreeage	.31

20-HERRICK TOWNSHIP

Sale # 183	Control	20-009028	Map Number	191.09-2,048.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$1,281.48
	Name	SPANO, MICHELINA EVELYN			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner	C/O ROSE LALLEY		Acreeage	.13

26-LENOX TOWNSHIP

Sale # 218	Control	26-050956	Map Number	262.00-1,015.00,025.	Minimum Bid	\$523.16
	Name	COSGROVE, TIFFANY			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner			Acreeage	0

Sale # 222	Control	26-014724	Map Number	225.00-1,066.00,000.	Minimum Bid	\$1,170.68
	Name	LANGHAN, THOMAS & LINDA JOAN			Bid	No Bid
Status	NO BID	Co-Owner			Acreeage	1.0

33-NEW MILFORD BOROUGH

Sale # 261 Control 33-035929 Map Number 109.06-1,078.00,001. Minimum Bid \$387.76
Name BROAD, RENEE L Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner 51 DELAWARE STREET Acreage 0

34-NEW MILFORD TOWNSHIP

Sale # 268 Control 34-036887 Map Number 091.00-2,010.00,001. Minimum Bid \$400.65
Name ARSENAULT, CLARENCE & VELMA Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

35-OAKLAND BOROUGH

Sale # 278 Control 35-054260 Map Number 054.00-5,008.00,001. Minimum Bid \$4,118.46
Name GRAVES, TINA Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage 0

39-SPRINGVILLE TOWNSHIP

Sale # 316 Control 39-011297 Map Number 257.00-1,017.00,000. Minimum Bid \$6,484.70
Name BUDZINSKI, RICHARD & LISA Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage .48

40-SUSQUEHANNA BOROUGH W1

Sale # 331 Control 40-058373 Map Number 054.14-2,005.01,000. Minimum Bid \$677.49
Name CALLAHAN, SHAWN ACE Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner & COLLEEN J Acreage .17

42-SUSQUEHANNA BOROUGH W2

Sale # 349 Control 42-012077 Map Number 054.11-2,038.00,000. Minimum Bid \$6,294.34
Name SESTO, MICHAEL & PAULA Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner Acreage .15

44-THOMPSON BOROUGH

Sale # 354 Control 44-012324 Map Number 115.09-1,027.00,000. Minimum Bid \$23,040.63
Name ODELL, REBECCA Bid No Bid
Status **NO BID** Co-Owner & REBECCA CORDNER Acreage .93